
Secondly, ELSS is an equity fund with a lock-in period of three years. Gains on equity investments held for more than a year are 
taxed as long term capital gains tax. This is levied at the rate of 10% upon redemp�on. However, long term gains of up to Rs 1 
lakh/year are tax-exempt. So, you will only pay tax if your profits exceed Rs 1 lakh in a financial year. Compared to the short 

 

What are ELSS mutual funds?

 

Doesn't it feel great when the pani puri guy gives you an extra puri in the end? Or when you get a seat in the metro, even 
during the busiest hours? These small joys are what make life wonderful! Likewise, tax benefits are one of the most sought-
a�er joys of the inves�ng world. And Equity Linked Savings Schemes (ELSS) can be your source of happiness in this case. Let's 
find out how!

These mutual funds invest in equity and equity-related securi�es. They func�on like any other mutual fund and allow you to 
invest in a lump sum or start an SIP online (Systema�c Investment Plan). However, they have one different feature from other 
mutual funds – a lock-in period of three years. 

ELSS mutual funds can offer several benefits. Let's see what these are:

1. ELSS tax benefit: 

You get more tax benefits than one when you invest in ELSS. Firstly, you can claim tax deduc�ons of up to Rs 1.5 lakh every 
financial year under Sec�on 80C of the Income Tax Act, 1961. This can help you save up to Rs 46,800 in taxes every year. 

ELSS funds are o�en referred to as the tax saver mutual fund under 80C! More on this, along with other advantages of ELSS, 
has been discussed below. 

Benefits of ELSS

ELSS – One mutual fund, several benefits! 
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Equity funds are known for genera�ng infla�on-bea�ng returns over a long investment horizon. So, you can use ELSS funds to 
target your long-term goals. Moreover, the lock-in period ensures that you stay invested for at least three years. This, in turn, 
contributes to be�er returns with the power of compounding. Therefore, not only do you earn returns on your primary 
investment but also on the return generated on your investment.  

term capital gains tax of 15% levied on gains when you invest in equity for a year or less, this is a win-win situa�on! Since your 
gains on ELSS are long term capital gains by default, you will either pay lower taxes or enjoy en�rely tax-free returns.

2. Infla�on-bea�ng returns:

Alterna�vely, you can use this formula too:

However, since manual calcula�ons can some�mes have errors, you can use an online ELSS calculator to double-check. 

Investment Amount (1 + Expected Rate of Returns) ^ Time Horizon

Circling back to the lock-in period once again, there is yet another advantage of ELSS mutual funds. ELSS has the shortest lock-
in period of three years in the group of investments included in Sec�on 80C. Other op�ons like the tax-saving fixed deposit, 
Public Provident Fund (PPF), Na�onal Pension Scheme (NPS), life insurance, etc., have longer tenures before you get to redeem 
your money.  

How to calculate returns on ELSS mutual funds?

An ELSS calculator can help you calculate your returns from ELSS mutual funds. All you need to do is enter the investment 
amount, the dura�on of the investment, and other similar informa�on and the calculator will compute the returns for you. You 
can even modify the values to see how the changes in investment or tenure impact your returns and accordingly make a 
decision. 

3. Short lock-in period:

Summing it up

Equity-linked savings schemes hit the nail on the head with tax deduc�ons, infla�on-bea�ng returns, and a rela�vely lower 
capital gains tax. So, if you want to invest in equity mutual funds and enjoy these not-so-li�le joys of life (read inves�ng), you 
can consider adding them to your por�olio.

 

When is the best �me to invest in ELSS mutual funds? 

No ma�er when you are reading this, the best �me to invest in mutual funds like ELSS is now. ELSS saves tax and offers 
infla�on-bea�ng returns. So, the sooner you start, the sooner you stand to benefit from it. This is not a scheme that deserves 
a�en�on right before the tax filing season. Instead, it can be effec�vely used to plan for various financial goals. To tackle the 
vola�lity associated with equi�es, you can invest in ELSS through SIPs. As such, you can spread your investment amount 
throughout the �me you have and gain from inves�ng during different market situa�ons. 


